STEP-BY-STEP TO BID DOWNLOAD

ENSURE YOU HAVE DOWNLOADED THE LASTEST VERSION OF JAVA ON YOUR SYSTEM BEFORE
YOU START

NOTE: THAT FOR A FIRST TIME LOG IN TO SRM7.0 A SECOND REQUEST FOR PASSWORD CHANGE IS
REQUIRED AND WILL SHOW WHERE NECESSARY.

Visit NipeX website www.nipex-ng.com
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e Click login tab and select E-Market 7.0
e Type in your userlD and password in the appropriate place in the SAP Netweaver Window
e Click on Logon in the SAP Netweaver window

User ID = |
Password *
Logon]|

Logon Problems? Get Support

~ - ISAP
© 2008 SAP AG. All rights reserved

For first time log in to SRM7.0, a window shown below will appear
o Current Password = Enter Initial Password sent to you
o New Password = Enter A password different from your NipeX Main Password
o Repeat Password = Repeat the password above

o Password has expired

Change Password

User ID uatbidders07
Old Password *

New Password *

Confirm Password =

Change | | Cancel |

e Click on Change
e Click on NipeX Rfx and Auction
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e A window as shown below will appear
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e Fill in same information as above and click on change
e Click on continue

e Click on Workcenter, then click on Refresh tab

e Click on the Event Number of the bid of interest

&

Welcome UAT BIDDERSO07 Sitemap | FAQ | Contact Us | Log off
Sl
I35 oS . 000
‘Welcome to NipeX \ l e &/‘.
<y pran
141¢1 4
0 Workcenter A
Active Queries A
eRFxs All (150) Published (0) Ended (0) Completed (1)
eAuctions All (1) Published (0) Ended (0) Completed (0)
eRFxs - All
» Show Quick Criteria Maii 06 | cH
View [Standard View] LI Display Event || Display Response Print anew] Refresh | Expon4|
B3 Event Number Event Description Event Type Event Status Start Date End Date Response Number Response Status Event Version
J 2100001149 3 NAE 00000554 Request for Proposal  Published 31052017 No Bid Created 1
J 2100001148 NAE 00000555 Request fr Quotation  Published 31.05.2017 No Bid Created 1
J 2100001147 NAE 00000556 Double Env.Tender Published 31.05.2017 No Bid Created 1

Downloading bids that are RFP
e Click on Notes and Attachment tab
e Click on the Collaboration RFx 2100000XXX in the collaboration section

e From the SAP MySAPPLM/C-folder Page, click on Folder
e Click on Mass download, then click on Continue

RFx Number 2100001149 Smart Number NAE 00000554 RFX Status Published RFx Start Date Submission Deadline 31.05.2017 16:00:00 WAT Ren
RFx Owner Mr. Prof. OLUSOLA UATBUYERSO08 RFx Version Number 1 RFx Version Type Active Version
Close Print Preview | Refresh | Participate | | Do Not Participate | Tentative |  Questions And Answers (0) | Export | PQQ || System Information || Create Memory Snd
RFX Information ltems ’l-
~ Notes
Add || Clear
Assigned To Category Text Proview

=

- Attachments
Add Attachment || Edit Description || versioning Delete || Create Qualification Profile
Assigned To Category Description File Name Version Processor Checked Out Type Size (KB)

[E] The table does not contain any data

= Collaboration

Create || Assign | Delete |
Collaboration Created on
Collaboration RFx 2100001149 2 <~ Taiy = 19.04.2017 18:04:03




N>y mySAP PLM
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cFolders \ ' Collaboration on the Web
ome Refresh Search Favorifes Seffings Help Logout
gla
I I Folder Folder Help
Ww Current Path: Collaboration RFx 2100... > Public Area > Folder
&Public Area E
Folder
! Folder
1 To save any changes made, click Save.
o
Subscribe D
Aozt
Notifications| [Mass Download] [Additional Functions 4] [Cancel]
Choose an object to display the folder objects. To copy objects, select the required objects and then choose Copy.
Folder Contents Booknaak
NameX Current Version I ‘Road lStatus ‘Changed by Changed on
@& ntpy/tmnipex-ng.com/sap(bD1ILIZIPTMXMCZkPWIpbg== O ~ & || @B Mass Download from Folde...
=¥

=

EYY e

Collaboration on the Web

Favorites  Seftings Help Logout

Slal Mass Download from Folder Folder Help
@conaboration REx 2100001149 Navigation: Folder Overview
= Current Path- Collaboration REx 2100 _ > Public Area > Folder > Mass Download from Folder
Public Area [~
@ Folder Here, select the files that you want to download locally and then choose Next
Select Documents J Continue |
Name File Name File Size
™ ERADVERT doc ADVERT.doc 122,016
M EeiNANCIAL CAPABILITY. doc | FINANCIAL %20CAPABILITY. doc 122,016
[7][ HSSE doc 122,016
2 [ rech i rase TECH%20ITT doc 122,016
[ recirraces | TECH9%20ITT doc 122,016

From the Select target directory for download, (Downloading to External hard drive: please note that you
must have inserted the external drive immediately after logging in)

= Click on Drive C:/ drop down button

= Select your external drive, then click Continue

mySAP PLM -
cFolders h 4 A : Collaboration on the Web
Home Favorites  Settings Help Logout
2l al
Mass Download from Folder Folder Help
#conaboration RFx 2100001149 Navigation:  Folder Overview
& public Area v Current Path:  Collaboration RFx 2100 > Public Area > Eolder > Mass Download from Folder

ﬂ Folder

Select the local directory to which you want to save your files and choose Continue.

Name GroBe

35 0
& Program Files

5 Program Files (x86)

3 Recovery

& SWSETUP

- System Volume Information
- Ld SYSTEM.SAV
4 Users
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+
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OR
From the Select target director for download, (Downloading into the Desktop, document or download
section of your PC)
» Click on the drop down button [+]users
= Click on the drop down button [+]Your PC Name
= Click on the drop down button [+]desktop/document/download
= Click on the target folder
» Click Continue.
» Log out of the SAPMYSAPPLM/C Folder page
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Mass Download from Folder Folder Help
n( >ollaboration RFx 2100001149 Navigation Folder Overview
9 Current Path:  Collaboration RFx 2100 > Public Area > Folder > Mass Download from Folder
Public Area ~
A Foider Select the local directory to which you want to save your files and choose Continue.
Select Target Directory for Download
Drive: C:\]
c\
hp
inetpub
Intel
MSOCache
PerfLogs
Program Files
Program Files (x86) Program Files
ProgramData m Files (x86) 20480
Recovery
SWSETUP
# 5 System Volume Information s
— NS e I SvTEMSAY 205
F =3 Al USers - |
L3 Default | Windows 28672
[+ Default User _c|windows.old 4096
[#-d Default.migrated CNXTHDASUP.LOG 54957
——>>(1- (2 GBOLAHAN | hiberfil.sys 8464728064
-3 NipeX Admin |0S 0
=-Ca Public ||pagefile.sys 1342177280
+1-C4 Windows swapfile.sys 268435456
+-Ld Windows.old
+Lg) .0penpgpstuaio l:‘ [ — e
+ (4 .oracle_jre_usage —diRecovery ! 0
44 AppData \-c|SWSETUP [ 4096
4 (3 Contacts |-|System Volume Information | 4096
++ =] Desktop Ld|SYSTEM.SAV [ 4006
+d Documents l_d|Users [ 4096
+-Ld Downloads LdWindows | 28672
+ (3 Favorites l_d|Windows.old | 4096
++L3 IntelGraphicsProfiles |CNXTHDASUP.LOG | 34957
- Cd Links [hiberfil.sys | 8464728064
Navigation Eolder O A
Current Path REx 2100 = Public Area = Folder = Mass Download from Folder
Select the local directory to which you want to save your files and choose Confinue.
Select Target Directory for Download
=1  Name Grofe
- e

Craate New Diractory
Fath: |Cil\Users\GEOLAHAN\Desktop\Key\

2_—5 Continue cancel

Explore

Downloading bids that are RFQ
Visit NipeX website www.nipex-ng.com
e Click login tab and select E-Market 7.0
e Type in your userlD and password in the appropriate place in the SAP Netweaver Window
e Click on Logon in the SAP Netweaver window
e Click on NipeX RFx and Auction Tab
e Click on Workcenter, then click on Refresh tab
e Click on the Event Number of the bid of interest
e Click on Notes and Attachment tab
¢ On the Attachment Section, Click on Hyperlink Description of the Document
e Click on save on the pop up that comes up to download the Commercial ITT Document to your
Computer or Storage Device
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Display RFx : 2100001148 Help i
RFx Number 2100001148 Smart Number NAE.00000555 RFX Status Published RFx Start Date Submission Deadline 31.05.2017 16:00:00 WAT Remaining Time 13 Days 03:32:13
RFx Owner Mr. Prof. OLUSOLA UATBUYERSO8 RFx Version Number 1 RFx Version Type Active Version ‘
| Close| | Print Preview| | Refresh| | Participate || Do Not Participate | Tentative | Questions And Answers (0 ) | | Export || Q0 || System Information | | Create Memory Snapshot ]
RFX Information Htems Notes and Attachments |
w Notes (i}
Add « || Clear

Assigned To  Category

=

Text Preview

w Attachments
Add Attachment || Edit Description || Versioning « || Delete || Create Qualification Profile |
Assigned To Category Description l)_ File Name Version Processor
Document Header Standard Attachment LONMMITE FINANCIAL CAPABILITY doc 1
w Collaboration
Create l Assign \ nnu-ls-J
Collaboration Created on

[E] No collaboration has yet been created

Filter Settings

Filter Settings
Checked Out Type  Size (KB) Changed By Changed On
] doc 22 UATBUYERS08 19.04.2017

Close Print Preview Fl% Do you want to open or save FINANCIAL CAPABILITY.doc from trn.nipex-ng.com?

Open S#& =1 cancal x

For Bids that are Double Envelope Tender (DET) (To Download Technical ITT documents)

Visit NipeX website www.nipex-ng.com
e Click login tab and select E-Market 7.0

e Type in your userlD and password in the appropriate place in the SAP Netweaver Window

e Click on Logon in the SAP Netweaver window

e Click on NipeX RFx and Auction Tab

e Click on Workcenter, then click on Refresh tab

e Click on the Event Number of the bid of interest
e Click Tech RFx

e From the SAP MySAPPLM/C-folder Page,

e Click on external folder under the Public Domain
e Click Mass Download

Welcome to NipeX

.D“‘ 1 ‘ Active Queries

eRFxs AN(150) Published (0) Ended (0) Completed (1)

eAuctions Al (1) Published (0) Ended (0) Completed (0)

NipeX®

~

eRFxs - All
» Show Quick Criteria Maintenance | 2_ cr
View [Standard View] [~| _Display Event Refresh | Export 4
B Event Number Event Description Event Type Event Status Start Date End Date Response Number Response Status Event Version
| 2100001149 NAE 00000554 Request for Proposal  Published 31052017 000003740 Submitted 1
| 2100001148 NAE 00000555 Request fr Quotation ~ Published 31052017 No Bid Created 1
E7: 2100001147 NAE 00000556 Double Env.Tender  Published 31052017 No Bid Created 1

=

ome
ST
el Folder EXTERNAL

Schpicalbele Current Path: Collaboration => ..

o . > EXTERNAL
) _COLLABORATION Folder
ﬂ—EXIEBNAL To save any changes made, click Save.
Name EXTERNAL
Subscribe [m]
Authorization Read

Refresh Search Favorites Settings Help Logout

Help

Notifications|[Mass Download|[Additional Functions 4| Cancel|

Choose an object to display the folder objects. To copy objects, select the required objects and then choose Copy.

Folder Contents

|Copy| [Copy as Bookmark| None

Name. Current Version Read Status|Changed by Changed on
[ UAT [19.04.2017
1|EBADVERT doc ‘ADVERT.doc (23KB) <2 BUYEROS |17:52:26
q EINANCIAL CAPABILITY . doc UAT 19.04.2017
CO|EFINANCIAL CAPABILITY doc| 53ih) S BUYEROS 1752107
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[19.04.2017
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w mySAP PLIVI
cFolders

Home

==

~ & | @ Mmass Download from Folde...

Collaboration on the Web

Favorites  Seftings Help  Logout

Mass Download from Folder Folder Help

@conaboration REx 2100001149 Navigstion:  Fokler Overview

Current Path:  Coll. ion REx 2100 > Public Area > Eolder > Mass Download from Folder
Public Area I~
@ Folder Here, select the files that you want to download locally and then choose Next
[Ssct Documens I (G ()
| 'Name File Name [ File Size
L
M EAovERT doc ADVERT doc 22,016
|
M EBlriNANCIAL CAPABILITY doc FINANCIAL%20CAPABILITY doc 22,016
| M Essse doc HSSE doc 22,016
| Ld } !
|~ B recH 11T doc TECH%20ITT doc 22,016
EBhecH 1 doc 1 TECH%20ITT doc 22,016

e Click Continue
From the Select source directory for download, (Downloading to External hard drive please note that
you must have inserted the external drive immediately after logging in)

= Click on Drive C:/ drop down button

= Select your external drive, then click Continue
mySAP PLM .

cFolders Collaboration on the Web
Home Favorites Settings Help Logout
Slis]
Mass Download from Folder Folder Holo
@conaboration REx 2100001149 Navigation:  Folder Overview
aPublic Area 1] Current Path: ion REx 21 > Public Area > Eolder > Mass Download from Folder

S Foider Select the local directory to which you want to save your files and choose Continue.

Select Target Directory for Download

3 orive: €] -
= c:\
& SRECYCLE.BIN Seame: GroBe
< hp
L5 inetpub
i Lo Intel
& (& MSOCache
T 0
# Lo Program Files
+ L Program Files (x86) =
+ o ProgramData “|Program Files (x86)
+ & Recovery " Programbata
+ (o SWSETUP O
+ (& System Volume Information {SWSETUP
# (o SYSTEM.SAV i System Volume Information
— & o users |SYSTEM.SAV

OR
From the Select source directory for download, (Downloading into the Desktop, document or download
section of your PC)
= Click on the drop down button [+]users
» Click on the drop down button [+]Your PC Name
» Click on the drop down button [+]desktop/document/download
= Click on the target folder
= Click Continue.
* Log out of the SAPMYSAPPLM/C Folder page

For Bid that are Double Envelope Tender (DET) (To Download COM ITT documents)
Visit NipeX website www.nipex-ng.com
e Click login tab and select E-Market 7.0
e Type in your userlD and password in the appropriate place in the SAP Netweaver Window
e Click on Logon in the SAP Netweaver window
e Click on NipeX RFx and Auction Tab
e Click on Workcenter, then click on Refresh tab
e Click on the Event Number of the bid of interest
e Click Notes and Attachment
¢ On the Attachment Section, Click on Hyperlink Description of the Document

e Click on save on the pop up that comes up to download the Commercial ITT Document to your
Computer or Storage Device
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RFx Number 2100001147 Smart Number NAE 00000556
RFx Owner Mr. Prof. OLUSOLA UATBUYERSO08

RFX Status Published
RFx Version Number 1

RFx Start Date
RFx Version Type Active Version

Submission Deadline 31052017 16:00:00 WAT Remaining Time 13 Days 02:29:34

Close Print Preview Refresh | | Do Not Participate | Tentative | Create Response | Questions And Answers (0) | Export|| PQQ | Technical RFx | | System Information | | Create Memory Snapshot |

RFX Information Items Notes and Attachments \

w Notes

Add Clear

Assigned To Category Text Preview
W Attachments
Add Attachment || Edit Deseription || Versioning . || Delete \ Create Qualification Profile Filter
Assigned To Category Description File Name Version Processor Checked Out Type Size (KB) Changed By
’_ Document Header Standard Attachment LOMMITE FINANCIAL CAPABILITY doc 1 [ doc 22 UATBUYERS08

w Collaboration
Create | Assign || Delete
Collaboration Created on

[3] No collaboration has yet been created

kemory Snapshot

Filter Settings

Seltings

Changed On
19.04.2017

Close Print Preview R% Do you want to open or save FINANCIAL CAPABILITY.doc from trn.nli x-nI.:uw Open Save | T Cancel

STEP-BY-STEP TO BID UPLOAD

Visit NipeX website www.nipex-ng.com
e Click login tab and select E-Market 7.0

]

]

e Type in your userlD and password in the appropriate place in the SAP Netweaver Window

e Click on Logon in the SAP Netweaver window

e Click on NipeX RFx and Auction Tab

e Click on Workcenter, then click on Refresh tab

e Click on the Event Number of the bid of interest
From the display RFx page

e Click Participate button, then click on Create Rfx Response button
Display RFx : 2100001148

RFx Number 2100001148 Smart Number NAE 00000555 RFX Staty
RFx Owner Mr. Prof. OLUSOLA UATBUYERSO08 RFx Version Number 1

Status Published RFx Start Date
ri RFx Version Type Active Version

Submission Deadline 31052017 16:00:00 WAT Remaining Time 13 Days 022934

1 Closel L Print F’reviewl Refresh ‘ L Participate I | Do Not Participate I |

1| Create Responsa | Questions And Answers (0)| Export| P00 Technical RFx | System Information Create Memory Snapshot|
5

RFX Information Items Notes and Attachments

RFx Parameters Questions Note and Attachments Table Extensions Payr]

For an RFP bid
e Click on Notes and Attachment
e Click on RFX Resp 30000xxxx under collaboration section

Help

o From the SAP MySAP PLM/C-folder Page, ensure the drop-down button is displaying your company

name then Click on folder
e Click on Mass Upload button, then Click Continue

Create RFx Response

RFx Response Number 3000003740
Remaining Time 14 Days 04:49:00

RFx Number 2100001149 Status Saved
RFx Owner Mr. Prof. OLUSOLA UATBUYERS08

Submission Deadline 31.05.2017 16:00:00 WAT
Total Value 0.00 NGN

Opening Date 11.06.2017 10:00:00 WAT

RFx Response Version Number Active Version RFx Version Number 1

Help
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e o

~ Notes =

Add o || Clear | Filtor Settings
Assigned To  Gategory Test Previow

—

~ Attachments

0

Aad Attachment | it @ te Qualiication Profile Filter Settin

Assigned To Category File Name Version Processor Checked Out Type Size (KB) Changed By Changed On

[E] The table doas not contain any data

~ Collaboration

Croate || Assign || Delete
Collaboration Room Created on
RFxResp 3000003740 UAT Bidder 07

A

mySAP PLM

0

~1

cFolders Collaboration on the Web
ome Refresh  Search Favorites  Settings Help Logout
=)
| | Folder Folder Help
ﬁﬁw Gurrent Path: Gollaboration REx 2100._. = RFxResp 3000003740 UAT.. > Folder

RFxResp 3000003740 UAT Bidder 07[v| | Foider

Folder 1 To save any changes made, click Save.
Name | Folder ]
Subscribe D
Authorization | Write |

Notifications] [Mass Upload][Mass Download][Additional Functions 4|[Cancel

To create folder objects, select Create. To copy or delete objects, select the required objects and then choose Copy or Delete.

Folder Contents. Upload PDX Package] [Create Copy as Bookmark Delete

Names Current Version [ Read |Status |Changed by Changed on
== ]
Mass Upload into Folder Folder Help
EHlColaboration REx 2100001149 Navigation:  Eolder Overview
& Current Path:  C: ion REx 2100 .. > RExResp 3000003740 UAT. . > Folder > Mass Upload into Folder
RFxResp 3000003740 UAT Bidder 07 [V
S Folder Mass Upload into Folder

Decide here which strategy you want to use for the upload if the system determines that a file of the same name already exists in the folder in cFolders. For
new files, the system always creates a new document

@ Always create a new version in the document
O Always overwrite the current version

O Always create a new document

(oL IEY | Cancel

From select source directory for Upload (Uploading from External hard drive. (Please note that you must
have inserted the external drive immediately after logging in)

e Click on Drive C:/ drop down button
Select your external drive, then click on the target folder
Click Select All, then click Continue
After uploading, Click Save button
Then log out from C-folder and close the

AP PLIVI =) ’
cFolders = X

Collaboration on the Web

Favon tes  Settings  Help  Logout

Mass L into Help
Navigation:  Eolder Overview
Current Path: G REx 2100 > RExResp 3000003740 UAT > e > Mass Upload into Folder

cal source directory and select the individual files. Then choose Continue.

2
RFxResp 3000003740 UAT Bidder 07 [~
S rorger

e chozen upload strategy Always create a new version in the document.

Select Source Directory for Upload
———orve: [~ |
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From select source directory for Upload (Uploading from Desktop, document or download section of your
PC)
Click on the drop down button [+]users
Click on the drop down button [+]Your PC Name
Click on the drop down button [+]desktop/document/Download
Click on the target folder
Click select all if all the documents in the folder are to be uploaded if not select the relevant
documents
Click Continue
o After uploading, Click Save button
Then log out from SAPMYAPPLM/C-folder and close the page



Then return to Create Rfx Response page

Click on Add Attachment

Click on Browse

Pick and upload any of the Company statutory document
Click ok to upload

Then Click Submit Button to submit the bid

Mass Upload into Folder Folder

Navigation:
Current Path:  C:

Zl=

H¥colaboration REx 2100001149 Folder Overview

REx 2100 > 3000003740 UAT. .. = Folder > Mass Upload into Folder

RFxResp 3000003740 UAT Bidder 07 [~|
S Foider

Choose the local source directory and select the individual files. Then choose Confinue.

You have chosen upload stralegy Always creafe a new version in the document.
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(1) Programpata

(i1 ) Recovel
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mySAP PLM

cFolders Collaboration on the Web

Search

Favor

» l ﬁl Folder Folder

Current Path:  C REx 2100 > RExResp 3000003740 UAT

Data was saved<gp——

Folder

Sconaboration REx 2100001149 > Folder

RFxResp 3000003740 UAT Bidder 07 [V
ﬂ Folder
To save any changes made, click Save

Name
Subscribe

Authorization Write

]

) [Notifications| [Mass Upload] [Mass Downioad| [Additional Functions «|[Gancel|

To create folder objects, select Create. To copy or delete objects, select the required objects and then choose Copy or Delete.

[kl et [Uptoad PDX Package] [Greate] [Easte]
Namen Current Version Read |Status |Changed by Changed on
| EapveRT.doc ADVERT doc (23KB) e RFC USER RFC USER  [17.05.2017 11:10:55
I:l mELNAN.QIAI..QAEAELI.ﬂm EINANCIAL CAPABILITY doc (23KB) f RFEC USER RFC USER 17.05.2017 11:10:56
[ EeiNANCIAL CAPABILITY doc 1 EINANCIAL CAPABILITY doc (23KB) e UAT BIDDERS07 17.05.2017 11:33:21
(| @ﬂumwz EINANCIAL CAPABILITY doc (23KB) ﬂ UAT BIDDERSO7 18.06 2017 14:34:12
I:l m HSSE doc (23KB) ﬂ UAT BIDDERSO7 18.05 2017 14:34:13
[ Bgexresp 3000008740 hitp:#rn nipex-. REC USER REC USER | 17.05.2017 11:10:56
[ | EBrecH imT doc TECH ITT doc (23KB) d REC USER RFC USER | 17.05.2017 11:10:56
1 mTECH ITT.doc 1 TECH ITT doc (23KB) ﬂ RFC USER RFC USER 17.05.2017 11:.10.56
M EBrecu T doc 2 TECH ITT doc (23KB) 4 UAT BIDDERS07 17.05.2017 11:33:23
Create RFx Response Help
RFx Response Number 3000003745 RFx Number 2100001148 Status In Process Submission Deadline 31.05.2017 16:00:00 WAT Opening Date 11.06.2017 10:00:00 WAT

Remaining Time 13 Days 00:43.08 RFx Owner Mr. Prof. OLUSOLA UATBUYERS08 Total Value 0.00 NGN RFx Response Version Number Active Version RFx Version Number 1

Submit| Close

Read Only || Print Preview | Check | | Save | Export || Import | Questions And Answers ( 0) || System Information | Create Memory Snapshot
RFx Information ltems Notes and Attachments Summary Tracking
~ Notes | =
Add Attachment
Add 4 |
R kel W Text Praview Here you can upload an attachment. You have to assign it to sither the document general data or to an item
File I Browsa. .. ,El?
Description
i * General Data | =
~ Attachments 2 Assian To (=] =1
| Add Attachment
Assigned To Category Description File Name Version nged On

“4
= | OK| | cancel

Submit | | Close | Read Only | | Print Preview | Check || Save || Export| | Import || Questions And Answers (0) || System Information | | Create Memory Snapshot |

For an RFQ bid
Visit NipeX website www.nipex-ng.com

e Click login tab and select E-Market 7.0

e Type in your userlD and password in the appropriate place in the SAP Netweaver Window
e Click on Logon in the SAP Netweaver window

e Click on NipeX RFx and Auction Tab

e Click on Work center, then click on Refresh tab
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Click on the Event Number of the bid of interest

Click Participate button, then click on Create Response button
Click on Notes and Attachment, then Click Add Attachment
Click Browse, then Double Click on target Commercial document
Name Document on Description

Then Click Ok to upload

Repeat the process for the number of documents to be uploaded
Then Click Submit Button

Create RFx Response

RFx Number 210000114¢ Status In Process

>n Deadline  31.05.2017 16:00:00 WAT Opening Date 11.06.2017 10:00:00 WAT

RFx Owner Mr. Prof. OLUSOLA UATBUYERS08 Tota 00 NGN RFx Response Version Number Acti

RFx Version Number 1

Submit| Close Read Only | | Print Preview Check | | Sava | | Export| | Import || Questions And Answers (0) | | System Informatien | | Greate Memery Snapshot

RFx Information ltems Notes and Attachments Summary Tracking

» Notes |

Add Attachment.

Here you can upload an attachment. You have to assign it to sither the document general data or to an item
File: I || Browse.. |

Description
Assign To: * General Data | ~
~ Attachments (2 o =l

Add Attachment |

<
| OK]  cancal

2ead Only || Print Preview Check | Save || Export || Import | | Questions And Answers ¢ 0) | System Information | Create Memory Snapshot

For a Double Envelope Tender (DET)

Visit NipeX website www.nipex-ng.com
e Click login tab and select E-Market 7.0
e Type in your userlD and password in the appropriate place in the SAP Netweaver Window
e Click on Logon in the SAP Netweaver window
Click on NipeX RFx and Auction Tab
Click on Workcenter, then click on Refresh tab
Click on the Event Number of the bid of interest
Click Participate button, then click on Create Response button
Click on Tech Rfx Response Button
From the SAP MySAP PLM/C-folder Page, Click Tech_bid (Ensure the Tech_Bid is a sub-folder
under your company name folder)
e Click on Mass Upload button, then click on Continue

Display RFx : 2100001148 Help
RFx Number 2100001148 Smart Number NAE. 00000555 RFX Stat{ Status Published RFx Start Date Submission Deadline 31.05.2017 16:00.00 WAT Remaining Time 13 Days 02.29:34
RFx Owner Mr. Prof. OLUSOLA UATBUYERSO08 RFx Version Number 1|4 RFx Version Type Active Version
| Close | . Print Preview | Refresh [ Participate | | Do Not Participate | | 1| Create Response | Questions And Answers (0)| Export] POQ| Technical RFx | System Information | Create Memory Snapshot |
~
RFX Information ltems Notes and Attachments ]
RFx Parameters Questions Note and Attachments Table Extensions Payr|

Create RFx Response Help

RFx Reaponae Number 3000003741 RFx Number 2100001147 Status In Procass Submission Deadline 31.062017 160000 WAT Opening Date 18.06 2017 10:00.00 WAT
Remalning Tims 14 Days 04:11:08 REx Gwner Mr. Prof. OLUSGLA UATBUYERSOS Total Value 0.00 NEGN REX RespoAES VErslon NUmMBer Active Version REx Version Number 1

K Line 1: Product catesery 1_13_99 does not axist

1

Submit | Slose Read Oniy | | Print Proview | Ghoek | | Save | | Export | | impert And Answers (0) || Teshnical RFx | | System infarmation || Greate Memery

REx Information ama

summary Trackin a

Basic Data Motes and



http://www.nipex-ng.com/

Tech. Responses
»

mySAP PLIMV = :
cFolders i y . Collaboration on the Web

Home Refresh Search Favorites Settings Help Logout
ST
Folder UATBIDDERSO07 i
L re_f]h"'ca' Dotalls Current Path: Collaboration > ... > ... > UATBIDDERS07
o= ...
< .. Folder
Dﬂw To save any changes made, click Save.
_COLLABORATION
[ EXTERNAL Name [UATBIDDERS07 ]
Subscribe =]}
Authorization | Read ]
Notifications|[Additional Functions 4|[Cancel
Choose an object to display the folder objects. To copy objects, select the required objects and then choose Copy.
Folder Contents [Copy| [ Copy as Bookmark None
Name~ |Current Version | ]Read |Status |Changed by Changed on
2 /ﬂ O|EOTech Bid | ‘ | \ REC USER RFC USER 17.05.2017 11:48:53
=
Ta create folder objects, selact Create. To copy or delete objects, select the required objects and then choose Cepy or
Delete.
Folder Contents [Upload PDX lGreata]| |Copy as Bookmark| [ 0| [ Dalata|
N ~ [Curren: t Version | |Reada | = by [<i on
Empty |
==l
Mass Upload into Folder Tech_ Bid Heoloe
@HiTechnical Details Navigation: E o
v':'vD Current Path: Collaboration = ... = ... = UATBIDDERSO07 = Tech Bid = Mass Upload into Folder
[ _UATBIDDERSO7 Mass Upload into Folder
Decide here which strategy you want to use for the upload if the systemn determines that a file of the same name already
1 COLLABORATION exists in the folder in cFolders. For new files, the system always creates a new document.

O EXTERNAL
@ Always create a new version in the document
O Always overwrite the current version
<O Always create a new document

[SELRUEREE | Cancel

From select source directory for Upload (Uploading from External hard drive. Please note that you must

have inserted the external drive immediately after logging in)
e Click on Drive C:/ drop down button

e Select your external drive, then click the target folder
Click Select All if all the documents in the folder are to be uploaded if not select the relevant
documents

e click Continue

e After uploading, Click Save button

e Then log out from SAPMySAPPLM/C-folder and close the page

on the Web
Help

Logout

2| =]

Mass L into Help
@ couanoration REx 2100001148 TSR
2 , Gurrent Path: Gollahoration RFx 2100 _ > RExResn D AT S B Alnar arneh Uitoea Thes rataer
RFxResp 3000003740 UAT Bidder 07 |~
= Bl i o e et B R Aie) Hike: oA Bhesse Cinwie

You have chosen upload strategy Always create a new version in the document.

o)
of
of
of
of

From select source directory for Upload (Uploading from Desktop, document or download section of your

PC)

Click on the drop down button [+]users

Click on the drop down button [+]Your PC Name

Click on the drop down button [+]desktop/Document/Download
Click on the target folder

Click Continue
After uploading, Click Save button
Then log out from SAPMyAPPLM/C-folder and close the page

Click Select all if all the documents in the folder are to be uploaded, if not select relevant documents
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M¥colaboration REx 2100001149

Mass Upload into Folder Folder

Navigation:  Folder Overview

RFxResp 3000003740 UAT Bidder 07 [~|

S Fola

mySAP PLM

cFolders

2| &

mcollahorahun RFx 2100001148

&
RFxResp 3000003740 UAT Bidder 07 [V|

S Folder

Current Path

Collaboration RFx 2100... > RExResp

Choose the local source directory and select the individual files. Then choose Gontinue.

You have chosen upload stralegy Always create a new version in the document.
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Folder Folder

Current Path:  Collab:

Folder

Fx 2100, > RFxResp 3000003740 UAT. .. > Folder

Data was saved<g—""""

To save any changes made, click Save

Name
Subscribe

Authorization

O

MNotifications || Mass Upload || Mass Download ||Additional Functions 4||Cancel

| Galact an | Nalata All Salactions

avoriles S

To create folder objects, select Create. To copy or delete objects, select the required objects and then choose Copy or Delete

Folder Contents

Names

| EanverT doc

UEIoad PDX F'ac"aae Create

Current Version
ADVERT doc (23KB
EINANCIAL CAPABILITY doc (23KB)

Read |Status Changed by

RFC USER RFC USER
RFC USER RFC USER

Collaboration on the Web

[Paste

Changed on
17052017 11:10:55

17.05.2017 11:10:56

EINANCIAL CAPABILITY doc (23KB)
EINANCIAL CAPABILITY doc (23KB)
HSSE doc (23KB)

UAT BIDDERSQO?
UAT BIDDERSO07
UAT BIDDERSO7

17.05.2017 11:33:21
18052017 14 34:12

18052017 14:34:13

RExResp 3000003740
| Breck 111 doc
| Bhrech 1 doc 1

hitpo/trn nipex-
IECH ITT doc (23KB)
JECH ITT doc (23KB)

REC USER RFC USER
REC USER RFC USER
RFC USER RFC USER

17052017 11:10:56
17052017 11:10:56
17.05.2017 11.10:56

MErecH T doce 2

COM ITT For Double Envelope Tender
e Then return to Create Rfx Response, Edit Response or Display Response Page

Click on Notes and Attachment
Click on Add Attachment

Click on Browse and Double click on Target Commercial Document
Name Document on Description window
Click OK to upload

Repeat the process for all documents to be uploaded

e Then click Submit Button to submit the bid

Create RFx Response

Create RFx Response

RFx Response Number
Remaining Time

=
Submit| Close

3000003743

13 Days 01.07 55

RFx Number 2100001147
RFx Owner Mr. Prof. OLUSOLA UATBUYERS08

Status In Process

Submission Deadline
Total Value 0.00 NGN

SR% (RRRLNN

JECH ITT.doc (23KB)

31.05.2017 16:00:00 WAT Opening Date

UAT BIDDERSO07

| History,

18.06.2017 10:00:00 WAT

17.05.2017 11:33:23

Help

Technical RFx Responsa

RFx Response Version Number Active Version

System Information

RFx Version Number 1

Create Memory Snapshot

Here you can upload an attachment. You have to assign it to sither the document general data or to an item

I || _Browse . |

General Data |~

=

led on

Ok || cancel

Read Only | | Print Preview | Check | | Save || Export || Import | | Questions And Answers (0 )
RFx Information Iterms Notes and Attachments Summary Tracking
- Notes ,
Add 4 Add Attachment
Assigned To  Category Text Preview
File:
Description:
- Attachments 2. Assign To: *
Add Attachment |
Assigned To Gategory Deseription File Name Version
Submit || Close | Read Only | | Print Preview Check | | Save | Export || Import || Questions And Answers (0 )

Technical RFx Response | | System Information | | Create Memory Snapshot




EDITING YOUR RESPONSE

e From work centre, check on relevant Response Number
o From Display Response or Edit Response page, click edit button
¢ Continue on the relevant steps for the RFx type to carry out the changes required

DEALING WITH COMMON ERRORS WHILE SUBMITTING A BID

Error Message (RFP): Please Attach Tech. Doc. in 'Notes and Attachments-Collaboration Section' [This
error is displayed when a company does not attach documents in C-folder through the RFXResp 300000XXXX

hyperlink (RFP)]

Error Message (DET): Please Upload Technical Document in Tech Rfx Response! [This error is displayed
when a company does not attach documents in C-folder through the Tech Rfx Response Button (DET)].

To resolve this error, the company should access the collaboration link or Tech Rfx Response Button on the
response and upload documents.



